
$4200.00 / Monthly - 3045 TRAILSIDE DRIVE
 

Listing ID: W9044158

$4200.00 / Monthly
3 Bedrooms, 3 BathroomsSingle Family

3045 TRAILSIDE DRIVE, Oakville,
Ontario, L6M4M2

Discover unparalleled luxury in this brand
new, never-lived-in 3-bedroom, 3-bathroom
executive end unit freehold townhome
Backing to a Ravine, featuring the finest
finishes, a high-ceiling open-concept layout,
a large terrace off the family room perfect
for entertaining, and a family-sized gourmet
kitchen equipped with top-of-the-line
appliances and custom cabinetry. The
primary bedroom boasts a private ensuite
bathroom with modern fittings and its own
secluded balcony, providing a serene retreat.
Nestled in a lush, park-like setting, this
home offers superior connectivity to major
transit routes and highways, making
commuting a breeze, and is surrounded by
an array of fine dining establishments,
world-class shopping centers, and a
beautiful shoreline for recreational
activities. Additionally, it is located near
some of the best public and private schools
in the GTA, ensuring top-tier educational
opportunities for your family. With energy-
efficient systems, smart home technology,
ample storage solutions, and a spacious
garage, this townhome perfectly combines
elegance, convenience, and modern living.
**** EXTRAS **** AAA Tenants, No
Pets/Non-Smokers. Landlord Require All
Rental Related Documents To Be Up To
Date. (id:13137)
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